3.5.2.1 Revenue generated from consultancy during the last five years
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Beneficiary's Name

Beneficiary's Code *
Beneficiary's Address

€

Client Ref N
Date
Bank Refererce No

We have ini-iated a credit to the Account N

PAYMENT ADVICE

RASI SEEDS PVT LIMITED2562

COIMBATORE
COIMBATORE

:Comptroller

: PAYMENT

:Comptroller
:29/05/2018
:N149180550369271

Rs.60000 tarough NEFT for the below mentioned details.

IFC Code
Micr Code
Beneficiay Bank Name
Beneficia'y Brn Name
Payment L:tails
Payment Ietails
Payment Jetails
Payment Detailg
Payment Details
Payment Details
Payment Details

N U W

:SBIN0D006925

:STATE BANK OF INDIA

:Testing Fee
:Hy-Paddy -RRX138
:NIL

:NIL

:NIL

:NIL

:NIL

This is Computer generated advice.

umber 10790107095 for the amount of

Does not rasquire any signature.

D



CIN: U01409UP2006PTC032379

~ AGRI SEEDS PVT. LTD.

To, Date:-12/06/2018 ‘

v

Dr. N.B.Singh - |
Director Research ) ‘
N.D University of Agriculture & Technology

| Kumarganj Faizabad

Uttar Pradesh

'

SUB: Testing of our paddy Res.variety DAMINI (Not Hybrid)

Dear Sir

As per my recent communication with you, we are herewith sending two kg of our above said paddy
Res. Variety for testing in your Kharif-2018 trials across the potential Jocations in Uttar Pradesh.

Sir, our above Res. Variety comes under mid-early group with medium slender type , hence ,please
include the corresponding duration and grain type varieties as local checks for comparison evaluation.

We are herewith enclosing D.D towards testing fee-
The details of the D.D as follows.

D.D number: 819464 (P.N.B Varanasi) Avn)”— K0, 50d)-

Dated: 08/06/2018

Kindly acknowledge the receipt of the same.

Thanks and Regards
p—
b
i,
A10.
T  AGRI.EXPER. SRATION ;, F : .
i Raceipt No....- .. . D\RF.GTOR
Date_‘.....],. él }3
.‘ ‘ — Registered Office. : Sector-N-491, Aashiyana Colony, Lucknow-226 012 Mob. : 9A'I' 5338916

A . oluNa 37, Survey No. 15, jayabheri Park, Kompally Villoge, Quthbullapur Mandal, Ranga Reddy Dist. Telangana. Mobile : 09415338
: KO Paeeesraveunici Villae, Shamirpet Mandal, R-R. Dist. '
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| Inbox (82) ¥
| Starred
|
[ Drafts (4)

More

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?tab=wm#ifbo

| |

Fwd: Re: NDUAT hybrid testing - drduat@gmail.com - Gmail

d: Re: NDUAT hybrid testing imoor

| | Lokesh K <lokesh.k@deltaseeds.in>
' tome

--emee--- Forwarded message ---------

From: Punit Paliwal <punitpaliwal@deltaseeds.in>
Date: Thu, Jun 14, 2018, 15:50

Subject: Fwd: Re: NDUAT hybrid testing

To: Lokesh K <|okesh k@deltaseeds.in>

wnnemmemee FOrWarded message --------=-

From: "Naresh Merampudi" <naresh@deltaseeds.in>
Date: 13 Jun 2018 18:35

Subject: Re: NDUAT hybrid testing

To: "Ravi Nageshwaar Rao" <m@deltaseeds.in>

Cc: "punit paliwal" <punitpaliwal@deltaseeds.in>

Respected Sir,

Please find the below NEFT details of NDUAT hybrid testing fee.

NEFI'/SK/AXFSK181640026939/702/COMPTROPLLER/SAKN177
Thanks&Regarths, MLN"; 103_3 olBf#15
Naresh |

On Wed, Jun 13, 2018 at 4:52 PM, Ravi Nageshwaar Rao <rn@deltaseeds.in> wi
- Dear Paliwal jj ” ‘

| Money was tfansferred through RTGS today. Please instruct for depositing the ¢
' RNRao !

Recoived Sued g, Dol M.b
pnd Deda h‘

g

h
1 Director Researe
A‘: nu. AT Kumarganj

.2ad
\/ },80000 — |3M20(g

________——F_——‘-‘
-

+1B401df0$3999265 i mn
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INDIA PESTICIDES LIMITED
¢ Wiater Works Road. Aisnbagh, Lucnkow
_ Rega Office -35-A Civi Lins Bareilly
(FY. 2019-2020)
CIN: U24112UP1984PLC006894
Comptroller ANDUA & T Kumarganj Ayodhya
, Ledger Account
1-Nov-2019 to 21-Dec-2019
g o Paget
Date  Particulars Veh Type Veh No. Debit Credit
212019 Cr Bank of India Clc Alc 400031  Bib pe BP-00731 12000000
Cheque - 355870 2112019 1.20,000.00 €
Cha No.355870 Issued to 0.0 Inf
fo Comptroller ANDUA & T
Kumargany Ayodhya
Cha No.355670 Issued to RTGS
Comptroller ANDUA & T
Kumarganj Ayodhya
1.20,000.00
Or Closing Balance 1.20,000.00

1,20,000.00  1,20,000,00






ISO 9001: 2008 WAl Worser

[CAR-INDIAN INSTITUTE OF WHEAT & BARLEY RESEARCH, KARNAL

mwmﬂ(wmmmm
W R Al vac, IR V5, FOTA-132001
g g

(AN 1SO 9001:2008 certified organization) R
TEAR " * PostBox No.158, Kunipura Road, Karnal-132001.
57TRYIIWBR/VC/20 16-17

Dated:- 27-02-2021
To

[

The Comptrol ler,

Narendra Devy University of Agriculture & Technology |
Kumarganj, Faizabad- 22422- up

Sub: Release of

grant to the Voluntary centre for conduct AICRP trials during the year
2020-21. :

nds amounting to Rs. 120000/- (Rs. One lakh twenty

0 your University account no. 10790107095 on dated

24-02 trials during the year 2020-2]

-2021 for conducting the AICRP - The deatail of the same

Net  grant
| released

i as under:-

Alloecation
2020-21

balance
adjusted as
per AUC

{

Yours faithfully
[ a4

(Dr. Pooghm Jasrotia)
54 rdination
Copy to:- .

d, Mahayogi Gorakhnath Krishi Vigyan Kendra,

Chaukmafi (Peppeganj), Jangal kaudiya, Distt. Gorakhpur-273001 (UP) for

information & n/a please,

2. Dr. Nitendra Praksh Crop Research Station GhaghraGhat, P.O Jarwal Road Baharaich
(UP) Pin - 2719001 for information &

n/a please,
3. Dr. Gyanendra Singh PI. Crop Imp

Tovement for information please,
4. FAO. [IWBR, Karnal for informaton please,
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PAYMENT ADVICE

To,
Vendor Code: 10010853

DR. GAJENDRA SINGH,
ACHARYA NARENDRA DEVA »

UNIVERSITY OF AGRI. & TECHNOLOGY,

Payment Advice No. | 1500028312

COMPTROLLER, ANDUAT, KUMARGAN]J Payment Date 15.06.2020

Mode of Payment NEFT

224229 AYODHYA Instrument No. ENET
Telephone No0.9453601240
. Bank Name HDFC Bank Ltd.-OUT
Bill Settlement Details.
Sr.No., Document No| Bill Ref. Bill Date Bill Amount Deductions Amount
Rs. Rs. Rs.
1 1500028312 6900041878 15.06.2020 480,000.00 0.00 480,000.00
Total 480,000.00 0.00 480,000.00
Net Amount Paid Rs. 480,000.00

RUPEES : FOUR LAKH EIGHTY THOUSAND Only

For MAHYCO PRIVATE LIMITED

Authorized Signatory

This is a computer generated document hence signature not required E.&O.E

r‘n@hq@@

EVERY SEED COUNTS

Mahyco Private Limited
(Formerly Sungro Seeds Private Limited)

Registered office: Tel: +91 22 6757 3000
19 Raj mahal, CIN: U74999MH1991PTC061969
84 Veer Nariman Road, info@mahyco.com

Mumbai-400020, India www.mahyco.com E.& O.E.
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GSP Crop Science Private Limited

‘ ‘ . Regd. Office : 404, Lalita Complex, 3" Floor, Nr. Jain Ti
A a 5 k emple, Navrangpura, Ahmedabad-380 009. Gujarat
‘ 'L\I Phone : 26466580, 26449936, FAX : +91-79-26448872 E-mail : info@gspcrop.in Website © www, ;;:::J;:DM'

2

SHEATERED

CIN NO : U24120GJ1985PTC0O07641.

GSP/HO/Prod Regn/2020/08/07 7% Date: 06/08/2020

3
-

To

The Comptroller,

Acharya Narendra Dev University of
Agriculture & Technology,

Kumarganj, Ayodhya- 224 229 Uttar Pradesh

Sub: Advance payment for testing of bio-efficacy trials on chilli & Paddy crop -regarding
Ref: Your letters No. 518/DR/2020 dated 01.07.2020
Dear Sir,

Wwith reference to your letter mentioned above we are releasing full advance payment
of Rs. 6,40,000/- by at par Cheque vide No. 219929 dated 05/08/2020 drawn on State Bank of
India for one season bio-efficacy trials of following products.

1. Thifluzamide 15%+Difenoconazole 20% SC on Paddy Crop-
2. Pymetrozine 30%+Tebuconazole 37% WG on Paddy Crop.
3. Methoxyfenozide 18 + Emamectin benzoate 1.8% SC on Chilli Crop.
4, Methoxyfenozide 20%+Chlorantraniliprole 5% SC on Chilli Crop.
You are requested kindly communicate to concerned scientist to initiate the trial at the earliest.

Kindly acknowledge the receipt of the same for our record.

Thanks
With regards
For GSP Crop Science Pvt. Ltd., Ahmedabad

Dr. Yashwaht C. K. V4

Authorized Signato

Encl:
(i) Cheque of Rs. 6,40,000/- vide No. 219929 dated 05/08/2020 drawn on State
Bank of India in favour of Comptroller, ANDUA&T, Kumarganj, Ayodhya.

Dr. Yashwant C.K.; Sr. Manager- Regulatory Affairs; Mo. 91-6359639208 (M); Email: yashwantck@gspcrop.in

Works : Unit-1 : 100-103, G.V.M.M. industrial Estate, Odhav, Ahmedabad-382415. Gujaral. INDIA
3350:1\2‘: 22900927, 22900528, Fax : +91-79-22902526, E-mail : i.ﬂfo@gsp‘cmp in
Pnsl-? .'551. Phase Il G..D.C., Kathwada, Opp. Ofs. Odhav Octrol Naka, Ai\medabad-fiﬂ?dlao
h‘ane : 22802556, 22900451, Fax : +91-798-22901047, E-mail : info@gspcrop.in
Unit-3 : Plot No. 1, G.1.D.C. Estate Nandesari-391340. Ph. No. 0265-2841517 Fax: +91-0265-2B4§7‘?7

Unit-4 : 391, 392, 405,406, Phase-Il, G.1.D.C. Kathwada, Ahmedabad-382430 Ph. No. : +01-79-22900228 5



RSBt rop Sciéhied PVELid. ™"

I. HO : 403 Lalita Complex, 352/3, Rasala Road, Nr. Mithakhali Six Road, Navrang Pura, Ahmedabad - 380 009 Gujarat, India.

Tel : 079 26466580 / 61915111 e-mail : accounts@gspcrop.in Website : www.gspcrop.in

rty Name :- .  Comptroller, ANDUA&T, Kumarganj, Ayodhya Voucher No. 150002908
-
. Date .08.
Comptroller, office ANDUA&T, Kumarganj, Ayodhaya % ?35 B
a 224229 Vendor Code 7103712
Y Bank Code 4038
Group EXP
We Enclose herewith Cheque No. 219929 Dated 05.08.2020
Drawn on State Bank Ofdndia, Overseas Branch Ahmedabad For Rs. 640,000.00
Rupees  g/v | AKH FORTY THOUSAND ONLY
; Invoice Description
Invoice Number Date IR w— _,_éngZ__. TDS/Deductions Amount Rs.
05.08.2020 640,000.00 0.00 0.00 640,000.00
Remarks: -Adv Pmt Agst JO: 6100001390 Dt:15.07.2020
Page 1 of 1 Total Amount :
Kindly send an acknowledgment receipt duly stamped and signed.
Prepared By Checked By Authorised Signatory
s W m h AFF 1. ISCON ELEGA‘NC& NR Pwma)msm 3 & 4 /v oo 01
e
N&/ State Bank Of India CROSS ROAD ©G. H;;;HWAY.AHM{DABAD-JBDU% l0l5l0[31220l2101
aenes DD M
PAY Ma_mumxnm , Ayodhya m’tmaﬁmwr OR ORDER
Wﬁ FLNPEES -ggpt LAKH FORTY THOUSAND ONLY
‘ s : sy | T | w0000

mm

J VALID UPTO T 50 LACS AT NON-HOME BRANCH
For GSP CROP SCIENCE PRIVATE

789777
'CASH CREDIT AIC 97897770003

; 1515400000

A MTIWGHEQUE P%yamu at Par atAl Braﬁches of SBI

P RN RO B IO E 3 e & foss i 4 k R T W A

S S

" 2L95929® 38000206811 000308 30
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Gmail - Permission to conduct a trial for testing of Fipronil 0.6 % GR- against Stem borer & Armyworm in Wheat for 2 seasons (Ra -

Gma;l Dr. Sameer Kumar Singh <skbhu1991@gmail.com>

\
N

rmission to conduct a trial for testing of Fipronil 0.6 % GR- against Stem borer
Armyworm in Wheat for 2 seasons (Rabi 2020 and Rabi 2021).

1 message

. ¥

Pl COORDINATION, IWBR, Karnal <pftoordination.iiwbr@icar.gov.in> Tue, Oct 20, 2020 at 3:13 PM
To: "drnduat@gmail.com” <drnduat@gmail.com> -

Cc: "skbhu1991@gmail.com"” <skbhu1991@gmail.com>, *spsnduat65@gmail.com” <spsnduaté5@gmail.com>,
"spsnduat1965@gmail.com” <spsnduat1965@gmail.com>, Director IIWBR <director.iiwbr@icar.gov.in>
v

4

Dear Sir, i

This is to inform you that ICAR-Indian Institute of Wheat and Barley Research
Karnal has received a request from Gharda Chemicals Limited, Maharashtra to
conduct a research trial for testing of Fipronil 0.6 % GR- against Stem borer &
Armyworm in Wheat for 2 seasons (Rabi 2020 and Rabi 2021). As the product is
required to be tested at four locations, we would like to choose Ayodhya as one of
the locations and want to include Dr. Sameer Kumar Singh, Assistant
Professor (Entomology) in the project as Co-Pl. Preliminary discussion about
the project details has already been done with Dr. Sameer Kumar Singh and Dr.
S.P. Singh (Assistant Professor, Plant Pathology-Wheat) telephonically.

As per ICAR guidelines, the product testing fee is Rs 20,000/treatment/insect
species/season. There are eight treatments proposed, therefore based on
calculations, the you will receive Rs. 6,40,000 (Rs. Six lakhs and forty thousand.
only) as contingency grant. The details of project cost calculations is given below:-

Treatments=8

Insect-pest spp.=2

Cost per treatment per season= Rs. 20,000/

Total cost per season=8x2x20,000/= Rs.3,20,000/

Seasons=2

Total cost for two seasons= Rs. 3,20,000/X2= Rs.6,40,000/ (Rs. Six lakhs
and forty thousand only) '

As a coordinator of the project, ICAR-IIWBR will receive the funds from the
company and then it will be distributed among institutions of co-investigators of
the project.

In this regard, please give permission to include Dr. Sameer Kumar Singh as Co-
Pi in the project and also for the conduction of the trial. Protocol for testing the
product is attached.

An early response from your side will be helpful.

Thanks and regards,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/07ik=fcdébfal 27 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1681 063633927214786&simpl=msg-f%3A16810636...
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1212212020 Gmail - Payment: BIO-Efficacy Evaluation of Prosulfocarb 80 EC against weeds of Wheat especially Phalaris Minor

" Gmall director research nduat <drnduat@gmil.com>
; }

ayment: BIO-Efficacy Evaluation of Prosulfocarb 80 EC against weeds of Wheat especially Phalaris Minor
nessages

+ Jain <dk jain@indliapesticideslimiled.com> Wed, Dec 16, 2020 at 4:09 PM
“Dr. Gajendra Singh” <dr.gsinghpc@gmail.com>
India Pesticides Limited <info@indiapesticideslimited.com>, director research nduat <dmduat@gmail.com>

Jear Sir,
We have made a payment of Rs. 1,20,000/- through NEFT dated 24/11/2020. UTR No. is BKIDN 20329251753,

Kindly confirm. ’

Regards,
Dr. S.MA. Rizvi

From: DK Jain <dk jain@indiapesticideshmited com>

Sent: 20 October 2020 13:41

To: Dr. Gajendra Singh <dr.gsingnpc@gmeail coms

Cc: India Pesticides Limited <info@indiapesticideslimiled com>

Subject: BIO-Efficacy Evaluation of Prosulfocarb 80 EC against weeds of Wheat especially Phalaris Minor

To, ®

The Director of Research

Narendra Deva University of Agriculture & Technology

Kumarganj, Ayodhya, 224 229 (U.P.).

K/A: Dr. Gajendra Singh

Sir,

The above trial was conducted at your place during 2019-20, has to be repeated during 2020-21 also. Planning may kindly be done accordingly.
Sample of chemical and testing fees will be sent to you shortly.

Thanks & Regards,

S.MA. Rizvi
Advisor

Dr. Gajendra Singh <dr.gsinghpc@gmail.com> . Thu, Dec 17, 2020 at 2:38 PM
To: dnduat@gmail.com .

[Cuoted et nidoen]



Nitrogen level trial on rice hybrid Ankur -7576

1 message

r ]
akchoudhary neri <akchoudhary114@yahoo.com> Sun, Jun 14, 2020 st QPZS’
To: "dr.gsinghpc@gmail.com" <dr.gsinghpc@gmail.com>, "drnduat@gmail.com"
<drnduat@gmail.com>
Cc: "Dr.Khedikar" <vpkhedikar@ankurseeds.com>, "Dr. Ashwin Kashikar"
<ashwinkashikar@ankurseeds.com>, "ravindra2012singh@gmail.com"

sravindra20123ingh@gmail.com>
Dear Sir,

With reference to your official letter no. 109/DR/2020 dated 06/06/2020 regarding testing of
our mid late group rice hybrid namely Ankur -7676 under three doses of nitrogen fertilizers
in your reputed university.

Ve have submitted 2 kg seed of hybrid Ankur -7576 along with other company market
check Arize -6444 Gold to Dr. Vedprakesh , Head , Dept. of Soil Science & Soil
Chemistry on 09/06/2020

The recommended dose of N:P: K will be as 150:75:75 kg/hectare respectively. The trial to
be conduct on fallowing three doses of Nitrogen:

1. 50 % Less than RDF (Nitrogen)

2. 75% Less than RDF (Nitrogen)

3. 150 kg Nitrogen /hectare (RDF)

The other fertilizers and agronomic practices to raise healthy crop will be applicable as per

= university guidelines. You are requested to do your needful. The testing fee of Rs 240000/-,
for nitrogen level trial and university trial will be transferred shortly in name of Comptrolier ,
ANDU&T,Kumargunj , SBI bank branch -Pathia.

L]

&

Thanking you
With Regards

Dr. Arvind Kumar

R & D Station - Prayagraj (UP)
Ankur Seed Pvt. Ltd

Mob: 9996610502

1—/&&



» GSP Crop Science Private Limited
‘; q . Regd. Office : 403, Lalita Complex, 3 Fioor, Nr. Jain Temple, Navrangpura, Ahmedabad-380 009. Gujarat. INDIA

Phone : 264668580, 26449936, FAX : +91-79-2644B872 E-mall : info@gspcrop.in Website : www.gspcrop.in
CIN NO : U24120GJ1985PTC007641

GSP/HO/Prod Regn/zozo/11/o?8 Date: 27/11/2020
-

To

The Directorate of Research,

Director of Research

Narendra Dev University of Agriculture and Technology,
Kumarganj, Ayodhya, Uttar Pradesh

Sub: Advance payment for testing of bio-efficacy of Topramezone 336 g/l w/v SC on Maize
Crop and Pyroxasulfone 85% w/w WG on Maize crop-regardin

Ref: No.Memo/DR/ Testing Fee/2020 dated 23.10.2020
Dear Sir,

With reference to your letter mentioned above we are releasing full advance payment
of Rs. 4,00, 000 & Rs. 4,00, 000 by at par Cheque vide No. 222222 & 222223 respectively, dated
26/11/2020 drawn on State Bank of India for one season bio-efficacy trials with fallow-up crop
of Topramezone 336 g/l w/v SC on Maize Crop and Pyroxasulfone 85% w/w WG on Maize
crop.

You are requested kindly initiate the trial at the earliest following the enclosed protocol.
Please ensure that two season trials should be completed within time as requested earlier.

Kindly acknowledge the receipt of the same for our record.

Thanks
With regards

Encl:

(i) Cheque of Rs. 4,00, 000 & Rs. 4,00, 000 by at par Cheque vide No. 222222 &
222223 respectively, dated 26/11/2020 drawn on State Bank of india in favour
of Comptroller, ANDUA&T, Kumarganj, Ayodhya.

Dr. Yashwant C.K.; Sr. Manager- Regulatory Affairs; Mo. 91-6359639208 (M); Email: yashwantck@gspcrop.in

Works : Unit-1 100-103, G.V.M.M. Industrial Estate, Odhav, Ahmedabad-382415. Gujarat. INDIA

* Phone : 22800927, 22900528, Fax +91-79-22902526, E-mail : info@gspcrop.in
Unit-2 551, Phase Il. G.I.D.C.. Kathwada, Opp. O/s. Odhav Octroi Naka, Ahmedabad-382430

I R Phone : 22902556, 22900451, Fax +91-79-22901047, E-mali! info@gspcrop.in
‘ME ?!S!: :X.ZW Unit-3 : Plol No. 1, G.L.D.C Estate Nandesari-391340. Ph. No. 0265-2841517 Fax: +91-0265-2840117

Unit-4 : 391, 392, 405,406, Phase-il, G.1.D.C. Kathwada. Ahmedabad-382430 Ph. No. : +91-79-22900228
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